
Habitat Mgmt. Cornerstone Griffin J. C. Dengel

David Steele Contracting Construction Carpentry

Caledonia, NY Rochester, NY Cohocton, NY Caledonia, NY

PACKAGE #1

MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS -  Price to include labor to install 

only unless otherwise noted. Price to perform task for each installation
Energy Star Rated CFL Installation - Price per bulb $10.00 $8.00 No bid $10.00
Smoke Detector (battery operated) - Price per detector $20.00 $35.00 No bid $15.00
CO Detector (battery operated) – Price per detector $20.00 $45.00 No bid $15.00
Door Weatherstripping – Price per weatherstrip $50.00 $28.00 No bid $25.00
Air Sealing – Materials & Labor per hour N/A $93.00 No bid N/A

PACKAGE #2

INSULATION PRICES - Cellulose ordered from Agency supplier - 

all other materials supplied by contractor.  Price to perform task.
Wall, Attic and Crawlspace Insulation to be quoted per square foot.  

Hot water insulation per lineal foot.

Wall Insulation – High Density  

                                                                4" $1.50 $1.45 No bid $3.25
                                                         6” $1.50 $1.62 No bid $4.87

Attic Insulation (open)  

                                                                            6” $1.50 $1.10 No bid $4.87
   8” $1.70 $1.25 No bid $6.45
  10” $1.90 $1.45 No bid $8.07

12” $2.10 $1.60 No bid $9.69
14” $2.25 $1.70 No bid $11.31

Attic Insulation (floored) – High Density  

                                                  6” $2.25 $1.55 No bid $3.50
                         8” $2.25 $1.75 No bid $5.25
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Hot Water Pipe Insulation – material and labor No bid $0.40 No bid $1.50
Kneewall, Fiberglass   - material and labor $2.50 $1.10 No bid $1.00
Rim Joists – option #1 – price per square foot $3.00 $0.90 No bid $3.25
Rim Joists – option #2 – price per square foot $4.00 $1.00 No bid $2.34
Rim Joists – option #3 – price per square foot $5.00 $1.10 No bid quote as needed
Crawlspace – 1.)  Floor Insulation, $5.00 $2.00 No bid $1.75
                       2.)  Dirt floor moisture barrier $1.00 $2.00 No bid $0.85
                       3.)  High R Wall board $5.00 $3.00 No bid $2.50
Soffit Vent                                              Quote per vent $25.00 $7.00 No bid $25.00
Gable Vent                                              Quote per vent $105.00 $34.00 No bid $225.00
Roof Vent                                               Quote per vent $225.00 $75.00 No bid $45.00
Soffit Baffles                                          Quote per baffle $10.00 $15.00 No bid $18.00

See notes

PACKAGE #3

WINDOW AND DOOR REPLACEMENT - Pricing to include labor 

and materials necessary to complete the project exclusive of

windows and doors.  Price to perform each task.

Vinyl Double Hung Windows    

                                                         0-79UI $300.00 $260.00 $180.00 $125.00
80-92 UI $325.00 $285.00 $180.00 $130.00

93-101 UI $350.00 $300.00 $180.00 $135.00
101-120 UI $375.00 $330.00 $180.00 $140.00

Vinyl Slider Windows  

                                                                      0-79UI $300.00 $260.00 $180.00 $125.00
80-92 UI $325.00 $285.00 $180.00 $130.00

93-101 UI $350.00 $300.00 $180.00 $135.00
101-120 UI $375.00 $330.00 $180.00 $140.00
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Vinyl Casement Windows    

                                                              0-79UI $325.00 $290.00 $180.00 $150.00
80-92 UI $350.00 $310.00 $180.00 $160.00

93-101 UI $375.00 $330.00 $180.00 $170.00
101-120 UI $400.00 $360.00 $180.00 $180.00

30x80 $800 - $1,200 $595.00 $290.00 $175.00
32x80 $800 - $1,200 $595.00 $290.00 $175.00
34x80 $800 - $1,200 $595.00 $290.00 $175.00
36x80 $800 - $1,200 $595.00 $290.00 $175.00

w/deadbolt & trim

EPA Renovation, Repair and Painting Certified? Will be Yes Yes Yes

Available throughout the contract term? Did not answer Yes Yes Yes 

References included? Yes Yes Yes Yes

Doors – Steel Insulated, 6-Panel, 9-Light (half glass) or Metal Fire Door

BID FOR WEATHERIZATION GENERAL CONTRACTORS

Bids opened January 27, 2012 - Contract period February 14, 2012 - May 31, 2012


